
FOI 414/2017 

REQUEST AND RESPONSE 

Please see costs for housing communal areas and sheltered housing heating and hot water 

attached.  As per 2b have also included the gas costs for our sheltered housing 

schemes.  We cannot provide the usage as these details are not recorded. 

Office accommodation 

Please see costs for housing communal areas and sheltered housing heating and hot water 

attached.  As per 2b have also included the gas costs for our sheltered housing 

schemes.  We cannot provide the usage as these details are not recorded. 

Part 1 

a.     Please provide a breakdown of the total amount of electricity consumed (in 
kWh) by your authority (for example, on local authority-owned buildings and 
services) for the year 2012 through to 2016 (or the most recently available five-
year period). 

                   This part is taking longer to find out – Info to follow. 

Part 2 

a. Please provide a breakdown of the total expenditure (in GBP) on electricity used 
by your authority (for example, on local authority-owned buildings and services) 
for the year 2012 through to 2016 (or the most recently available five-year 
period). 

 

These figures are for the whole Authority 

2011/12 - £432,646.82 

2012/13 - £438,134.04 

2013/14 - £463,280.80 

2014/15 - £502,737.76 

2015/16 - £517,548.94 

b.    Please provide a breakdown of the total expenditure (in GBP) on all energy used 
by your authority (for example, on local authority-owned buildings and services) 
for the year 2012 through to 2016 (or the most recently available five-year 
period). 

2011/12 - £267,564.70 

2012/13 - £357,317.83 

2013/14 - £324,350.09 



2014/15 - £315,464.94 

2015/16 - £258,147.42 

Part 3 

a. Please provide the proportion of the public lighting in your authority that is LED-
based? (Please provide as a percentage and, if possible, the total number of LED 
and non-LED lights across the authority).  
 

We do not hold this information. 

b.    Please provide the proportion of the public lighting in your authority that is 
connected LED lighting? By connected we mean lighting that is connected to 
allow features such as automated or remotely controlled adjustments to the 
lighting, data collection or integration with other systems in a building or town. 
(Please provide as a percentage and, if possible, the total number of connected 
LED lights across the authority).  

We do not hold this information. 

Part 4 

a. Please provide the proportion of the electricity consumed by your authority (for 
example, on local authority-owned buildings and services) that comes from 
renewable sources. 

 

Waiting for energy supplier to come back to us – info to follow 

Dovercourt Bay Lifestyles and Harwich Sports Centre 

Part 3 

a.         Please provide the proportion of the public lighting in your authority that is 

LED-based? (Please provide as a percentage and, if possible, the total number of 

LED and non-LED lights across the authority).  

 

Dovercourt Bay Lifestyles = 20% 

Harwich Sports Centre = 10% 

 

b.         Please provide the proportion of the public lighting in your authority that is connected 

LED lighting? By connected we mean lighting that is connected to allow features such as 

automated or remotely controlled adjustments to the lighting, data collection or integration 

with other systems in a building or town. (Please provide as a percentage and, if possible, 

the total number of connected LED lights across the authority).  

 



Dovercourt Bay Lifestyles = none 

Harwich Sports Centre = none 

 

Part 4 

a.       Please provide the proportion of the electricity consumed by your authority (for 

example, on local authority-owned buildings and services) that comes from renewable 

sources. 

Dovercourt Bay Lifestyles = none 

Harwich Sports Centre = none 

 

Frinton & Walton Swimming Pool 

123 units (87 LED’s and 36 old style) 

Manningtree Sports Centre 

There are 101 units at Manningtree, 75 are old style and 26 are LED’s 

Weeley Crematorium  

Part 1             This information is not readily available in our systems 

Part 2             This has been completed by Finance dept – Info to follow 

Part 3             This information is not readily available in our systems 

Part 4             0% (zero) 

 


