

FOI 259/2016

REQUEST AND RESPONSE

Please see response to your recent FOI request below in red.

1. For each of the financial years 2006/07 to 2015/16:

(a) How many social/affordable rented homes did your authority own as of the end of the financial year?

2006/07 – 3343

2007/08 – 3329

2008/09 – 3325

2009/10 – 3321

2010/11 – 3316

2011/12 – 3311

2012/13 – 3305

2013/14 – Figure not recorded

2014/15 – Figure not recorded

2015/16 - 3184 (Current stock)

(b) How many tenancy enforcement cases involving cannabis cultivation occurred in your authority's social/affordable rented properties?

2006/07 – One

2007/08 – None

2008/09 – None

2009/10 – None

2010/11 – One

2011/12 – One

2012/13 – One

2013/14 – Three

2014/15 - One

2015/16 - One

(c) How many tenant(s) were evicted as a result of cannabis cultivation?

2006/07 – One

2007/08 – None

2008/09 – None

2009/10 – None

2010/11 – One

2011/12 – One

2012/13 – None

2013/14 – None

2014/15 - None

2015/16 - None

(d) How many tenant(s) received suspended/postponed possession orders as a result of cannabis cultivation?

2006/07 – None

2007/08 – None

2008/09 – None

2009/10 – None

2010/11 – None

2011/12 – None

2012/13 – None

2013/14 – Two

2014/15 - One

2015/16 - None

2. For each of the financial years 2013/14, 2014/15, 2015/16:

How many of the cases involving cannabis cultivation identified in Q1 (b) occurred in properties affected by the 'bedroom tax'?

None in any of the last three years linked to bedroom tax.